UPLAND BOROUGH 224 Castle Avenue Upland, PA 19015

<u>MINUTES</u>	Bid Meeting Trash/Recycling Collection REBID
DATE	October 12, 2021
<u>TIME</u>	10:00 A.M.
<u>PLACE</u>	Upland Municipal Building, 224 Castle Avenue, Upland PA

ATTENDANCE

- Daniel Archdeacon, P.E., Catania Engineering Associates, Inc.
- Shannon Strigle, Administrative Assistant
- Two (2) Guests

Three (3) bids were submitted for the Trash/Recycling Collection for Upland Borough for years 2022 – 2026.

Bid #1: B & L Disposal, Wallingford, PA: Bid Bond for \$250.00 was submitted.

BASE BID

Trash Collection (5 year – twice weekly):

0	1 st year Trash:	\$ 165,000.00
0	2 nd year Trash:	\$ 165,000.00
0	3 rd year Trash:	\$ 165,000.00
0	4 th year Trash	\$ 173,250.00
0	5 th year Trash:	\$ 181,912.00

Recycling (5 year – twice monthly):

0	1 st year Recycling:	\$ 50,000.00
0	2 nd year Recycling:	\$ 50,000.00
0	3 rd year Recycling:	\$ 50,000.00
0	4 th year Recycling:	\$ 52,500.00
0	5 th year Recycling:	\$ 55,125.00

Special Bulk Waste (once monthly):

• Included with Regular Trash Collection for all five (5) years

ALTERNATE #1:

Trash Collection (5 y	year – 1x per week, exc	<i>cept</i> $5/1 - 9/30$ <i>at</i> $2x$ <i>per week</i>)
0	1 st year Trash:	\$ 133,200.00
0	2 nd year Trash:	\$ 133,200.00
0	3 rd year Trash:	\$ 133,200.00
0	4 th year Trash	\$ 139,860.00
0	5 th year Trash:	\$ 146,793.00
Recycling (5 year – a	once monthly):	
0	1 st year Recycling:	\$ 50,000.00
0	2 nd year Recycling:	\$ 50,000.00

0	3 rd year Recycling:	\$ 50,000.00
0	J your Recyching.	ψ 50,000.00

4th year Recycling: 5th year Recycling: \$ 52,500.00

\$ 55,125.00 0

Special Bulk Waste (once monthly):

0

Included with Regular Trash Collection for all five (5) years 0

ALTERNATE #2:

Trash	Collection (S	i year – once	weekly)
-------	---------------	---------------	---------

0	1 st year Trash:	\$ 118,300.00
0	2 nd year Trash:	\$ 118,300.00
0	3 rd year Trash:	\$ 118,300.00
0	4 th year Trash	\$ 124,200.00
0	5 th year Trash:	\$ 130,400.00
<i>Recycling</i> (5 year – o	nce monthly):	
0	1 st year Recycling:	\$ 50,000.00
0	2 nd year Recycling:	\$ 50,000.00
0	3 rd year Recycling:	\$ 50,000.00
0	4 th year Recycling:	\$ 52,500.00
0	5 th year Recycling:	\$ 55,125.00

Special Bulk Waste (once monthly except Dec.):

• Included with Regular Trash Collection for all five (5) years

H & H Waste, Sharon Hill, PA: Cashier's Check for \$250.00 was submitted. **Bid #2:**

NO Bid BASE BID

ALTERNATE #1 NO Bid

ALTERNATE #2 ONLY:

Trash Collection (5 y	ear – once weekly)	
0	1 st year Trash:	\$ 183,000.00
0	2 nd year Trash:	\$ 188,400.00
0	3 rd year Trash:	\$ 193,200.00
0	4 th year Trash	\$ 195,000.00
0	5 th year Trash:	\$ 201,600.00
<i>Recycling</i> (5 year – o	nce monthly):	
0	1 st year Recycling:	\$ 50,000.00
0	2 nd year Recycling:	\$ 52,525.00
0	3 rd year Recycling:	\$ 55,150.00
0	4 th year Recycling:	\$ 58,000.00
0	5 th year Recycling:	\$ 60,850.00
Special Bulk Waste (a	once monthly except D	ec.):
0	Included with Regula	ar Trash Collection for all five (5) years

		year – twice weekly):	¢ 245 (88 00
	0	1 st year Trash:	\$ 245,688.00
	0	2 nd year Trash:	\$ 254,544.00
	0	3 rd year Trash:	\$ 265,308.00
	0	4 th year Trash	\$ 275,796.00
	0	5 th year Trash:	\$ 287,964.00
Recycling (5 ye	ear – t		
	0	1 st year Recycling:	\$ 95,736.00
	0	2 nd year Recycling:	\$ 99,180.00
	0	3 rd year Recycling:	
	0	4 th year Recycling:	\$ 107,460.00
	0	5 th year Recycling:	\$ 112,200.00
Special Bulk W	aste (once monthly):	
-	0	Included with Regula	ar Trash Collection for all five (5) yea
ALTERNATE #	#1:	NO BID	
ALTERNATE # ALTERNATE #		NO BID	
ALTERNATE #	#2:	NO BID vear – once weekly)	
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio	#2:	vear – once weekly)	\$ 187,116.00
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio	#2: on (5 y	vear – once weekly) 1 st year Trash:	\$ 187,116.00 \$ 193,872.00
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio	#2: on (5 y 0	<i>year – once weekly)</i> 1 st year Trash: 2 nd year Trash:	\$ 193,872.00
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio	#2: on (5 y 0	<i>year – once weekly)</i> 1 st year Trash: 2 nd year Trash: 3 rd year Trash:	
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio	#2: on (5 y o o	<i>year – once weekly)</i> 1 st year Trash: 2 nd year Trash: 3 rd year Trash: 4 th year Trash	\$ 193,872.00 \$ 202,080.00 \$ 209,940.00
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio	#2: on (5 y o o o o	vear – once weekly) 1 st year Trash: 2 nd year Trash: 3 rd year Trash: 4 th year Trash 5 th year Trash:	\$ 193,872.00 \$ 202,080.00
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio Recycling (5 ye	#2: on (5 y 0 0 0 0 0 ear – c	<i>vear – once weekly)</i> 1 st year Trash: 2 nd year Trash: 3 rd year Trash: 4 th year Trash 5 th year Trash: <i>once monthly):</i>	\$ 193,872.00 \$ 202,080.00 \$ 209,940.00 \$ 219,252.00
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio Recycling (5 ye	#2: on (5 y o o o ear – c	<i>vear – once weekly)</i> 1 st year Trash: 2 nd year Trash: 3 rd year Trash: 4 th year Trash 5 th year Trash: <i>once monthly):</i> 1 st year Recycling:	\$ 193,872.00 \$ 202,080.00 \$ 209,940.00 \$ 219,252.00 \$ 95,736.00
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio Recycling (5 ye	#2: on (5 y 0 0 0 0 0 ear – c	<i>vear – once weekly)</i> 1 st year Trash: 2 nd year Trash: 3 rd year Trash: 4 th year Trash 5 th year Trash: <i>once monthly):</i> 1 st year Recycling: 2 nd year Recycling:	\$ 193,872.00 \$ 202,080.00 \$ 209,940.00 \$ 219,252.00 \$ 95,736.00 \$ 99,180.00
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio Recycling (5 ye	#2: on (5 y o o o ear – c o o	<i>vear – once weekly)</i> 1 st year Trash: 2 nd year Trash: 3 rd year Trash: 4 th year Trash 5 th year Trash: <i>once monthly):</i> 1 st year Recycling: 2 nd year Recycling: 3 rd year Recycling:	\$ 193,872.00 \$ 202,080.00 \$ 209,940.00 \$ 219,252.00 \$ 95,736.00 \$ 99,180.00 \$ 103,368.00
ALTERNATE # Trash Collectio Recycling (5 ye	#2: on (5 y o o o ear – c o	<i>vear – once weekly)</i> 1 st year Trash: 2 nd year Trash: 3 rd year Trash: 4 th year Trash 5 th year Trash: <i>once monthly):</i> 1 st year Recycling: 2 nd year Recycling:	\$ 193,872.00 \$ 202,080.00 \$ 209,940.00 \$ 219,252.00 \$ 95,736.00 \$ 99,180.00 \$ 103,368.00

• Included with Regular Trash Collection for all five (5) years

Mr. Archdeacon thanked everyone for their attendance and stated the bids will be submitted to the Upland Borough Council for recommendation.

The meeting was adjourned at 10:12 a.m.

Respectfully submitted,

Administrative Assistant/Recording Secretary